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Global Markets 

The South African rand and stocks rose on Tuesday as the dollar weakened after data showed a 
further decline in U.S. inflation, raising the prospect that the pace of Federal Reserve interest rate 
hikes will ease. 

At 1548 GMT, the rand traded at 17.2400 against the dollar, 2.2% stronger than its Monday close. 

At home, South Africa's ruling African National Congress stopped an impeachment process from 
being launched against President Cyril Ramaphosa, as most of its lawmakers followed party 
instructions to vote against a probe report on him. 

The dollar index, measuring the U.S. unit's value versus six major currencies, fell around 1% to 
103.99. 

The Daily Brief 



ETM Analytics said in a note the rand had pared back its earlier losses due to a wholesale sell-off in 
the dollar. 

Statistics South Africa data showed on Tuesday total mining output year on year in October 
compared to a revised 5.1% decrease in September. 

Other data showed business confidence, helped by an increase in new vehicle sales, share prices on 
the Johannesburg Stock Exchange (JSE) and manufacturing output. 

On the JSE, the Top-40 index ended 2.05% higher at 69,675 points, while the broader all-share rose 
1.9% to 75,835 points. 

The government's benchmark 2030 bond was slightly stronger, with the yield down 1 basis points to 
10.360%.  

 
Source: Reuters Refinitiv 
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The South African rand and stocks rose on Tuesday as the dollar weakened after data showed a 
further decline in U.S. inflation, raising the prospect that the pace of Federal Reserve interest rate 
hikes will ease. 
 
At 1548 GMT, the rand traded at 17.2400 against the dollar, 2.2% stronger than its Monday close. 
 
At home, South Africa's ruling African National Congress stopped an impeachment process from 
being launched against President Cyril Ramaphosa, as most of its lawmakers followed party 
instructions to vote against a probe report on him. 



 
The dollar index, measuring the U.S. unit's value versus six major currencies, fell around 1% to 
103.99. 
 
ETM Analytics said in a note the rand had pared back its earlier losses due to a wholesale sell-off in 
the dollar. 
 
Statistics South Africa data showed on Tuesday total mining output fell 10.4% year on year in 
October compared to a revised 5.1% decrease in September. 
 
Other data showed business confidence rose in November, helped by an increase in new vehicle 
sales, share prices on the Johannesburg Stock Exchange (JSE) and manufacturing output. 
 
On the JSE, the Top-40 index ended 2.05% higher at 69,675 points, while the broader all-share rose 
1.9% to 75,835 points. 
 
The government's benchmark 2030 bond was slightly stronger, with the yield down 1 basis points to 
10.360%. 
 
 
Source: Reuters Refinitiv 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Market Overview 

 
 
 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 
 



Notes to the table:  
• The money market rates are TB rates 

• “BMK” = Benchmark 

• “NCPI” = Namibian inflation rate 

• “Difference” = change in basis points 

• Current spot = value at the time of writing 

• NSX is the Overall Index, including dual listeds 
 

Source: Thomson Reuters Refinitiv 

Important note:  This is not a solicitation to trade and CAM will not necessarily trade at the 

yields and/or prices quoted above.  The information is sourced from the data vendor as 

indicated.  The levels of and changes in the yields need to be interpreted with caution due 

to the illiquid nature of the domestic bond market. 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

For enquiries concerning the Daily Brief please contact us at  

Daily.Brief@capricorn.com.na 

 

Disclaimer 

The information contained in this note is the property of Capricorn Asset Management (CAM).  The 

information contained herein has been obtained from sources and persons whom the writer believes 

to be reliable but is not guaranteed for accuracy, completeness or otherwise. Opinions and estimates 

constitute the writer’s judgement as of the date of this material and are subject to change without 

notice. This note is provided for informational purposes only and may not be reproduced in any way 

without the explicit permission of CAM. 
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